West Midlands Police Freedom of Information

REQUEST 1

1) Cost of policing for all 19 home games of Aston Villa Football Club during 2018/19
season (August 10, 2018 - May 12, 2019)

Overtime* costs — £244,768.99

2) Cost of policing for all 19 home games of Aston Villa Football Club during 2020/21
season (September 12, 2020 - May 23, 2021)

Overtime* costs — £6,722.45

3) Cost of policing first Aston Villa Football Club home fixture (v Newcastle United,
21/08/2021) of the 2021/22 season

Overtime* costs — £10,993.18

4) Average number of police on patrol per Aston Villa Football Club home game at the
Villa Park during 2018/19 season (August 10, 2018 - May 12, 2019)

Average number not recorded

5) Average number of police on patrol per Aston Villa Football Club home game at
Villa Park during 2020/21 season (September 12, 2020 - May 23, 2021)

Average number not recorded

6) Number of police on patrol during Aston Villa Football Club opening home game
against Newcastle United on August 21, 2021

85

7) Number of arrests made within one mile radius of Aston Villa Football Club’s
stadium during 2018/19 season due to football related incidents (August 10, 2018 -
May 12, 2019)

Figures not available

8) Number of arrests made within one mile radius of Aston Villa Football Club’s
stadium during 2020/21 season due to football related incidents (September 12, 2020 -
May 23, 2021)

2

9) Number of arrests made within one mile radius of Aston Villa Football Club’s
stadium during opening fixture of the 2020/21 season due to football related incidents
(v Newcastle United, 21/08/2021)

1
REQUEST 2

1) Cost of policing for all 19 home games of Wolverhampton Wanderers Football Club
during 2018/19 season (August 10, 2018 - May 12, 2019)

Overtime* costs — £186,609.18
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2) Cost of policing for all 19 home games of Wolverhampton Wanderers Football Club
during 2020/21 season (September 12, 2020 - May 23, 2021)

Overtime* costs — £11,744.19

3) Cost of policing first Wolverhampton Wanderers Football Club home fixture (v
Tottenham Hotspur, 22/08/2021) of the 2021/22 season

Overtime* costs — £21,362.28

4) Average number of police on patrol per Wolverhampton Wanderers Football Club
home game at the Molineux during 2018/19 season (August 10, 2018 - May 12, 2019)

Average number not recorded

5) Average number of police on patrol per Wolverhampton Wanderers Football Club
home game at Molineux during 2020/21 season (September 12, 2020 - May 23, 2021)

Average number not recorded

6) Number of police on patrol during Wolverhampton Wanderers Football Club
opening home game against Tottenham Hotspur on August 22, 2021

62

7) Number of arrests made within one mile radius of Wolverhampton Wanderers
Football Club’s stadium during 2018/19 season due to football related incidents
(August 10, 2018 - May 12, 2019)

5

8) Number of arrests made within one mile radius of Wolverhampton Wanderers
Football Club’s stadium during 2020/21 season due to football related incidents
(September 12, 2020 - May 23, 2021)

3

9) Number of arrests made within one mile radius of Wolverhampton Wanderers
Football Club’s stadium during opening fixture of the 2020/21 season due to football
related incidents (v Tottenham Hotspur, 22/08/2021)

0

*Please be advised that with regard to the cost of policing football matches, we only collate
the overtime that has been spent. This will not include any duty time worked on a football
match because this would constitute Police Officers carrying out their normal daily duties
and therefore not separately recorded/captured.
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