
West Midlands Police Freedom of Information

1. Between 1st January 2015 and 31st July 2022, the total number of drones reported as stolen within your force area and their 

corresponding dates. 

Year Total

2015 6

2016 23

2017 38

2018 25

2019 10

2020 4

2021 15

2022 5

Grand Total 126

2. Between 1st January 2015 and 31st July 2022 of those reported, please specify the make and model of each drone (if recorded). 

Make / Model 2015 2016 2017 2018 2019 2020 2021 2022 Grand Total

HD CAMERA 1 0 1

Aircraft 1 1 2

APX 1 1

Camera 1 1 2

DISCO DRONE OP ID OP-SMPRPR2 1 1

DJI 1 1

DJI MAJIC 1 1

DJI MAVIC PRO 1 1

DJI Mavic 2 Pro Drone kit 1 1

DJI SPARK 1 1 2

Electronic 2 1 3

Extra 1 1

Flying 1 1

HELICOPTER 2 1 3

HUDSON 1 1

JSF 1 1

MAVIC 1 1

MINI 1 1

MOTION 1 1
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Propal Neutron 1 1

QUADCOPTER 2 2

RC 1 1

TOY 1 1 2

Worx 2 2

ZYMA 1 1

Not stated 1 14 5 20

Not known / not recorded 4 16 24 23 4 71

Grand Total 6 23 38 25 10 4 15 5 126

3. Between 1st January 2015 and 31st July 2022 of those reported, please briefly breakdown and classify the type of theft, 

such as Theft from Motor Vehicle (TFMV), Burglary Domestic, Burglary Commercial, Robbery etc for each of the occurrences. 

2015 2016 2017 2018 2019 2020 2021 2022 Grand Total

ATTEMPT THEFT FROM SHOP/STALL 1 1 1 3

THEFT BY EMPLOYEE 2 2

THEFT FROM THE PERSON OF ANOTHER 3 3

THEFT DWELLING NOT MACHINE/METER 1 1 2

THEFT FROM MOTOR VEHICLE 3 4 3 10

THEFT IF NOT CLASSIFIED ELSEWHERE 1 2 2 5

THEFT FROM SHOP OR STALL 5 22 33 16 4 2 10 2 94

THEFT OTHER 1 1 2 3 7

Grand Total 6 23 38 25 10 4 15 5 126

4. Between 1st January 2015 and 31st July 2022 of those reported, please detail the cost of the stolen item(s). 

COST 2015 2016 2017 2018 2019 2020 2021 2022 Grand Total

19.99 1 1

20 1 1

24.98 1 1

25 1 3 4

29.79 1 1

29.99 1 1

30 2 2

32.5 1 1

40 2 2 1 5
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49.99 1 1 2

50 1 1 2

59.99 1 1 1 3

60 3 1 1 3 8

70 1 2 3

75 1 1

80 2 2

99 1 1

100 2 1 1 4

109.98 1 1

110 1 1

114 1 1

120 1 1 2

135 1 1

137 1 1

140 2 2

199 1 1

300 1 1

370 1 1

400 1 1

479.74 1 1

800 1 1

1039 1 1

1089 1 1

1169 1 1

3000 1 1

Not stated 1 4 19 14 7 3 11 2 61

Not known / not recorded 3 3

Grand Total 6 23 38 25 10 4 15 5 126

5. Between 1st January 2015 and 31st July 2022 of those reported, how many have been recovered and how many have led to a conviction? 

OUTCOME 2015 2016 2017 2018 2019 2020 2021 2022 Grand Total

Caution - Adult 1 1 1 3

Charge 2 6 7 6 1 22
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Charge / Summons (Alt Offence) 1 1

Community Resolution 1 1

Filed, no Susp, no further enq 3 14 27 16 6 66

Postal Charge 1 1 2

Susp ID: No Victim Support 1 1

Susp ID: Oth Evidential Difficulty 1 1 2 2 6

Charge or Summons 1 1 2

Investigation Complete: No suspect identified 3 2 2 7

Named Suspect identified: evidential difficulties 

prevent further action(no victim support) 1 1

Named Suspect identified: evidential difficulties 

prevent further action(victim support) 1 1

Grand Total 6 23 38 25 10 3 4 4 113

6. Between 1st January 2015 and 31st July 2022 of those reported, how many have identifying features recorded, such as a serial number?

IDENTIFYING FEATURE 2015 2016 2017 2018 2019 2020 2021 2022 Grand Total

Not stated 6 23 38 25 10 4 14 5 125

Serial Number 1 1

Grand Total 6 23 38 25 10 4 15 5 126
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